

PUBLIC AUCTION OF TAX DEFAULTED PROPERTIES - MAY 28-29, 2012 & JULY 21-24, 2012

SALE LOT	ASSESSEE	PARCEL NO.	NOTICE BK/PG	DEF. NO. YEAR	MIN PRICE	SOLD FOR	STATE PORTION	COUNTY PORTION	PUBLIC & ADVERT	RECORDING FEE	REDEMPTION TAXES	EXCESS PROCEEDS	SOLD TO:
1	Carpenter, Joanne Marie 1/3	003/082/14	2011-09059	03637 2004-05	3,900.00								REMOVED - DECEASED
2	Pinoli, Wayne	003/540/47	2011-09060	04704 2005-06	19,100.00			150.00		15.50	15,825.46 35.00		REDEEMED 3/29/12
3	Orenstein, Craig & Renee Russell	011/580/24	2011-11116	08598 2005-06	5,200.00			150.00		19.00	5,346.58 35.00		REDEEMED 3/29/12
4	Sohl, Marie	012/611/22	2011-09061	09221 2005-06	1,000.00	42,100.00	1.50	150.00 35.00	100.00 150.00	17.00 46.75 3.00	421.64	41,221.86 Dylan Cisney PO Box 693 Laytonville, CA 95454	
5	Hughes, Jeff Gabriel	013/580/56	2011-09062	10113 2005-06	1,500.00			150.00	100.00 150.00	13.00	856.24 35.00		REDEEMED 5/24/12
6	Wilson, Justin	013/780/13	2011-09063	10441 2004-05	5,500.00			150.00		27.50	10,076.94 35.00		REDEEMED 3/28/12
7	Sawyers, Lorin E.	014/310/15	1998-12624	044881 1992-93	2,900.00								NO BID
8	Armstrong, Samuel	014/340/04	2011-09064	11329 2005-06	1,000.00								REMOVED - DECEASED
9	Dockins, Magdalene E. 1/2	018/020/19	2011-09065	13176N 2005-06	34,000.00								REMOVED - 1 YR EXTENSION
10	Humecky, Timothy P.	019/370/20	2011-09067	14570 2005-06	68,000.00			150.00	100.00 150.00	19.00	63,962.86 35.00		REDEEMED 5/7/12
11	Black Oak Group Inc. 1/2	020/450/09	2009-09777	15619 2003-04	12,000.00			150.00	100.00	19.50	10,785.27 35.00		REDEEMED 6/13/12
12	Adamsen, Albert C. 1/2	033/190/28	2011-09068	21970 2005-06	2,200.00								REDEEMED 3/28/12 REJ CK REMOVED - IN CARE HOME
13	Finnegan, Barbara Z. Trust	037/070/01	2011-09070	24489 2005-06	2,100.00								REMOVED - DECEASED
14	Finnegan, Barbara Z. Trust	037/070/08	2011-09071	24493 2005-06	1,700.00								REMOVED - DECEASED
15	Walton, Jonathan D.	037/550/02	2011-09083	04608	7,900.00			150.00			4,850.19		REDEEMED 4/16/12

31	International Marketing Institute	096/313/0401	2007-12309	33052 2001-02	3,700.00				NO BID
32	Mino, Virginia 1/2	096/341/1001	2011-09137	33263 2005-06	2,800.00				NO BID
33	Brunton, Frances M. Ttee	097/041/0601	2011-09138	33372 2005-06	2,900.00				NO BID
34	Britton, William E. & Joyce 2/3	097/042/0201	2010-08539	33320 2004-05	13,600.00	150.00	22.50	12,703.81 35.00	REDEEMED 3/26/12
35	Daniel, Charles E.	097/075/0101	2004-15153	33142 1998-99	7,600.00				NO BID
36	Gardner, Angelina M. 1/2	097/101/0301 (corrected)	1992-015993 2009-03350	025528 1985-87	13,800.00				NO BID
37	Price, Eric H.	097/111/0201 (corrected)	2009-09767 2010-01009	33489 2002-03	5,300.00				NO BID
38	Fernandez, Mario P. & Victoria N.	097/133/0201	2007-12425	33531 2001-02	6,100.00				NO BID
39	Ballazar, Generoso Baccay	097/172/1101	2009-09764	33726 2003-04	5,300.00				NO BID
40	Valerio, Efen & Minerva	097/261/1201	2011-09139	34058 2005-06	3,500.00				NO BID
41	Hamilton, Harold Lewis	097/273/0801	2011-09140	34143 2005-06	3,400.00				NO BID
42	De Guzman, Enrico N. & Rose V.	097/274/1001	2007-13977	82711 2001-02	9,200.00				NO BID
43	Manney, Phyllis	097/274/11	2011-09141	34163 2005-06	2,900.00				NO BID
44	Marshall, Velda V.	097/295/0301	2007-12426	34080 2001-02	2,900.00				NO BID
45	Sweis, Odeh & Fairouz	097/305/0901	2008-09504	34225 2002-03	3,400.00				NO BID
46	Lewis, Scott & Dana	097/315/1301	2011-09142	34415 2005-06	4,600.00				NO BID
47	Lee, Sanford L. 1/2	097/330/0901	2008-09506	34400	5,700.00				NO BID

97	Schrage, Allen	108/132/06	2011-09186	39883 2005-06	25,600.00		150.00	15.50	22,170.53 35.00	REDEEMED 4/6/12
98	Miller, Robert M.	118/080/02	2011-09187	40265 2005-06	121,500.00		150.00	66.50	47,693.96 35.00	REDEEMED 3/28/12
		118/080/04	2011-09188	40266 2005-06			150.00		11,736.87 35.00	REDEEMED 3/28/12
		118/080/15	2011-09189	40276 2005-06			150.00		28,167.87 35.00	REDEEMED 3/28/12
		118/080/16	2011-09190	40277 2005-06			150.00		20,327.73 35.00	REDEEMED 3/28/12
99	Schrager, Barry Ttee	118/560/16	2011-09191	41029 2003-04	9,100.00		150.00		16,102.69 35.00	REDEEMED 2/21/12
100	Richardson, Jeff	132/162/05	2011-09193	45331 2004-05	7,700.00		150.00	2.50	6,965.34 35.00	REDEEMED 5/24/12
101	Oshita, Patricia	132/300/32	2011-09194	45556 2005-06	11,800.00	1.50	150.00 35.00	17.00 31.90 8.50	11,132.65 17,006.35	Besart Marina 150 Windsor Dr. Petaluma, CA 94952
102	Regelbrugge, Daniel E. & Heather	142/200/15	2011-09195	46727 2004-05	24,800.00		150.00	7.50	24,923.15 35.00	REDEEMED 4/13/12
103	Fausto, Francisco	147/253/0501	2011-09196	48854 2005-06	19,100.00		150.00	3.00	15,871.41 35.00	REDEEMED 5/10/12
104	Thompson, Joseph/	147/254/0801	2011-09197	48868 2005-06	9,200.00		150.00	16.50	7,382.62 35.00	REDEEMED 4/25/12
105	Cordis, Michael	163/082/03	2011-09198	06424 2005-06	4,400.00		150.00	29.00	2,100.54 35.00	REDEEMED 3/16/12
106	Musgrave, Dennis L. Jr. 1/2	179/080/47	2011-09202	03723 2005-06	7,300.00		150.00	24.00	7,665.29 35.00	REDEEMED 5/11/12
107	Sanchez, Froilan G. & Elisa A.	181/131/08	2011-09203	57278 2005-06	7,600.00					NO BID
TOTALS						90,628.00	6.00	68.00 434.90 101.20	404,073.88 405.00 910.00 15,300.12	73,487.88

Report date June 4, 2012