
SALE ASSESSEE PARCEL NO. NOTICE DEF. NO MIN PRICE SOLD FOR STATE COUNTY PUBLIC & RECORDING REDEMPTION EXCESS SOLD TO:
 LOT BK/PG YEAR PORTION PORTION ADVERT FEE TAXES PROCEEDS

 
1 Phillips, Mrs. Maxine 006-045-16 2012-09864 05699 6,900.00 150.00 32.39 6,952.67 REDEEMED 5/24/13

2005-06 150.00 7.50 35.00

2 Hernandez, Rogelio C. 1/2 007-091-25 2012-09865 97372 72,300.00 150.00 88,065.73 REDEEMED 3/11/13
2004-05 35.00

3 Richards, Michelle 008-053-26 2012-09866 06883 2,500.00 150.00 100.00 1,394.64 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 10.00 35.00

4 Nevele Holdings LLC 1/4 011-410-1101 2012-09867 08414 15,400.00 150.00 32.39 1,101.26 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 54.00 35.00

011-410-1701 2012-09868 08417 150.00 32.39 513.48 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

011-410-19 2012-09869 08419 150.00 32.39 2,646.80 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

011-480-01 2012-09873 08501 150.00 32.39 7,024.91 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

5 Locklin, Evan W. 011-410-37 2012-09870 08427 21,600.00 150.00 32.38 19,520.51 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 25.50 35.00

6 Siskiyou Land Conservancy 011-420-15 2012-09871 08456 1,500.00 86.52 REDEEMED 3/25/13
2006-07

011-420-16 2012-09872 08457 71.56 REDEEMED 3/25/13
2006-07

7 Lillicotch, John 012-710-55 2012-09874 09446 10,500.00 150.00 9,598.32 REDEEMED 3/22/13
2005-06 11.50 35.00

8 Augustine, Walt Succ Co-Ttee 1/2 014-200-39 2012-09875 11088 2,600.00 REMOVED 7/15/13
2006-07 ADDRESS PROBLEM

9 Augustine, Walt Succ Co-Ttee 1/2 014-200-40 2012-09876 11089 1,500.00 19,100.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 828.03 17,777.97 Jonathan Stauduhar
2006-07 35.00 185.00 21.45 6121 Van Fleet Ave.

6.50 Richmond, CA 94804

10 Todd, Clark 017-160-43 2012-09877 12501 15,900.00 150.00 32.38 5,814.79 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2005-06 150.00 3.50 35.00

11 Ellis, Jesse 1/2 017-350-64 2012-09878 07274 5,800.00 1,775.93 REDEEMED 1/14/13
2006-07 35.00

12 Dockins, Magdalene E. 1/2 018-020-19 2011-09065 13176N 40,000.00 150.00 35,124.53 REDEEMED 2/25/13
2005-06 7.50 35.00

13 Silverado Custom Homes LLC 027-041-45 2012-09880 17664 58,200.00 REMOVED 5/31/13
2006-07

14 Hurt, Timothy T. 1/2 032-360-03 2012-09881 21005 5,000.00 150.00 32.38 3,855.33 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 8.50 35.00
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15 Lauteren, Aaron Frederic & Christina 032-480-29 2012-09882 21361 7,600.00 40,200.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 6,937.40 32,760.60 Daniel Nielsen
Lynn 2006-07 35.00 185.00 44.55 PO Box 853

14.50 Occidental, CA 95465

16 Nelson, Gregory M. & Regina A 032-480-31 2012-09883 21363 13,200.00 150.00 32.38 11,148.63 REDEEMED 5/21/13
2006-07 150.00 11.50 35.00

17 Hakimzadeh, Debora 033-030-02 2012-09884 21581 4,700.00 REMOVED - SEALED BID
2006-07

18 Larsen, Christopher W. 1/2 036-100-24 2012-10003 23867 23,700.00 150.00 21,964.33 REDEEMED 4/22/13
2006-07 150.00 22.50 35.00

19 Smith, David L. & Patricia L. 038-213-07 2012-09887 25872 31,700.00 65,001.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 30,003.21 34,386.29 Simi Tour
2006-07 35.00 185.00 72.05 16155 Gibson Ln.

24.00 Potter Valley, CA 95469

20 Day, Jonathan B. 1/2 046-270-55 2012-09888 26647 46,600.00 150.00 32.38 57,275.04 REDEEMED 5/23/13
2005-06 150.00 16.00 35.00

21 Wuerfel, Dana G. 056-130-18 2012-1002 30488 12,200.00 150.00 2,036.40 REDEEMED 3/8/13
2005-06 35.00

Wuerfel, Dana G. 056-160-03 2012-09890 30505 150.00 1,453.40 REDEEMED 3/8/13
2005-06 35.00

056-160-04 2012-09891 30506 150.00 6,001.91 REDEEMED 3/8/13
2005-06 35.00

22 Norton, Paul D. & June E. 095-020-0301 2012-09893 32279 2,600.00 REMOVED - DECEASED
2006-07

23 Norton, Paul D. & June E. 095-040-1401 2012-09892 32309 2,700.00 REMOVED - DECEASED
2006-07

24 Tamayo, Jon T. 095-050-0801 2011-09079 32216 4,900.00 NO BID
2005-06

25 Gillette, Dorothy J. Ttee 095-083-0801 2012-09894 32361 2,500.00 1,400.00 1.50 16.00 1,256.10 Lots of Land LLC
2006-07 1,400.00 35.00 88.40 1.65 PO Box 1181

3.00 Riverton, UT 84065

26 Guthrie, James M. 095-110-15 2012-09895 32410 3,800.00 NO BID
2006-07

27 Norton, Paul D. & June E. 095-130-0801 2012-09896 32437 2,800.00 REMOVED - DECEASED
2006-07

28 Liu, Lyndon 095-170-0101 2012-09897 32463 2,300.00 1,300.00 1.50 16.00 1,138.88 Lots of Land LLC
2006-07 1,300.00 35.00 102.62 1.65 PO Box 1181

6.00 Riverton, UT 84065

29 Norton, Paul D. & June E. 095-201-0901 2012-09898 32502 2,900.00 REMOVED - DECEASED
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2006-07

30 Bates, Arthur D. 095-262-0901 2012-09899 32559 2,400.00 1,400.00 1.50 16.00 1,222.02 Peter Dal Paggetto
2006-07 1,400.00 35.00 120.48 1.65 27040 Ridge Rd.

5.00 Willits, CA 95490

31 Norton, Paul D. & June E. 095-262-1101 2012-09900 32561 2,600.00 REMOVED - DECEASED
2006-07

32 Norton, Paul D. & June E. 095-262-1201 2012-09901 32562 2,600.00 REMOVED - DECEASED
2006-07

33 Anderson, Cheryl L. 096-112-1301 2012-09902 32776 7,900.00 NO BID
2006-07

34 Trinidad, Bartolome J. & Rebecca D. 096-274-0301 2012-09903 33196 4,500.00 NO BID
2006-07

35 Minick, Kim C. & Regina C. 096-341-0701 2012-09904 33359 2,100.00 1,200.00 1.50 16.00 1,017.22 Lots of Land LLC
2006-07 1,200.00 35.00 124.28 1.65 PO Box 1181

6.00 Riverton, UT 84065

36 Hakimzadeh, Debora 097-052-0401 2012-09905 33525 2,600.00 NO BID
2006-07

37 Chau, K M 1/2 097-081-1001 2012-09906 33651 5,000.00 NO BID
2006-07

38 Scott, Frankie Ray 097-092-0501 2012-09907 33681 5,600.00 NO BID
2006-07

39 Gallardo, Glory E. & Claire B. 097-153-0401 2012-09908 33887 5,700.00 NO BID
2006-07

40 Deerwood Corporation The 097-160-0101 2012-09909 33905 4,300.00 NO BID
2006-07

41 Singh, Iqbal 1/2 097/220/1801 2012-09911 34126 5,700.00 NO BID
2006-07

42 Yamaguchi, Yutaka 097-283-1001 2012-09912 34314 4,000.00 NO BID
2006-07

43 Datu, Felino S. 1/2 097-293-0101 2012-09913 34342 4,500.00 NO BID
2006-07

44 Tuyor, Gonzalo M. & Florencia R. 098-021-0501 2012-09914 34736 4,300.00 NO BID
2006-07

45 Nisperos, Marivic D. 098-061-0601 2012-09915 34889 2,600.00 NO BID
2006-07
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46 Moore, Dennis 098-064-07 2012-09763 34738 3,600.00 NO BID
2003-04

47 Clark, David Rule & Susan Louise 098-113-1001 2012-09916 35139 4,300.00 NO BID
2006-07

48 Jackson, Edgar A. Jr. 1/3 098-181-1101 2012-09917 35617 5,000.00 NO BID
2006-07

49 Woods, Larry 1/2 098-264-1401 2012-09918 36024 3,100.00 1,900.00 1.50 6.96 16.00 1,653.04 Brian Grant
2006-07 1,900.00 35.00 185.00 2.20 3226 Kathy Way

2.50 Loomis, CA 95650

50 Redwood, Kathryn S. 098-271-1201 2012-09919 36040 3,100.00 2,100.00 1.50 115.63 16.00 1,736.87 Christoph Litschke
2006-07 2,000.00 35.00 185.00 2.75 242 36TH Ave. A

10.00 San Mateo, CA 94403

51 Senot, Melburga V. 098-272-0801 2012-09920 35952 4,500.00 4,500.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 3,822.67 187.33 Michael Gurevich
2005-06 35.00 185.00 4.95 28 Chestnut St.

2.50 Lynn, MA 01902

52 Anitkam, Praveena 098-322-0301 2012-09921 36202 2,700.00 NO BID
2006-07

53 Graham, John Allen 1/8 099-052-1501 2012-09922 36597 3,900.00 NO BID
2006-07

54 Ramirez, Augusto & Leticia 1/2 099-143-1101 2012-09923 36947 2,900.00 NO BID
2006-07

55 Farmer, Aaron & Lucianne C. 099-152-1101 2012-09924 36976 2,900.00 5,600.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 2,201.16 2,896.34 Rowena Torres
2006-07 35.00 185.00 6.60 4824 Telegraph Ave.

15.00 Oakland, CA 94609

56 Porter, Thomas H. & Peggy A. 100-062-0601 2012-09925 37192 3,400.00 NO BID
2006-07

57 Ernst, William & Debra 100-082-1401 2012-09926 37295 2,300.00 1,400.00 1.50 16.00 1,194.43 Brian Grant
2006-07 1,400.00 35.00 150.07 1.65 3226 Kathy Way

3.00 Loomis, CA 95650

58 Jones, Christopher G. & Lisa N. 100-164-0701 2012-09927 37674 3,300.00 150.00 2,891.46 REDEEMED 8/20/13
2006-07 185.00 40.50 35.00

59 Purnell, Molie 100-165-0801 2012-09928 37692 4,300.00 2,800.00 1.50 104.14 16.00 2,455.36 Brian Grant
2006-07 2,800.00 35.00 185.00 3.30 3226 Kathy Way

3.00 Loomis, CA 95650

60 Antonio, Nora B. 100-173-10 2012-09929 37734 2,700.00 NO BID
2006-07

61 Moral, Jesus F. & Gina S. 100-183-1101 2012-09930 37816 5,100.00 NO BID
2006-07
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62 Gatev, Krassimir & Albena 100-190-1401 2012-09931 37834 3,500.00 NO BID
2006-07

63 Lopez, Florence S J 100-221-1101 2012-09932 37989 3,200.00 3,200.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 2,583.46 125.54 Jeremiah Raxter
2006-07 35.00 185.00 3.85 27851 Bradley St., Suite 145

3.50 Menifee, CA 92586

64 Zamora, Rosario B. 100-235-1301 2012-09933 38132 3,400.00 2,100.00 1.50 8.16 16.00 1,845.84 Brian Grant
2006-07 2,100.00 35.00 185.00 2.75 3226 Kathy Way

8.50 Loomis, CA 95650

65 Gallardo, Glory E. & Claire B. 100-274-1101 2012-09934 38272 4,900.00 NO BID
2006-07

66 Green, Byron A. Jr. 105-300-01 2012-09935 39366 3,900.00 150.00 32.38 2,869.00 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 5.50 35.00

67 Haendle, Timothy A. & Laura L. 106-130-3401 2012-10005 39283 27,400.00 53,026.62 REDEEMED 1/14/13
2002-03 35.00

68 Cordova, Eric A. 107-051-34 2012-09936 39643 28,700.00 150.00 32.38 25,136.74 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 44.50 35.00

69 Wood, Paulette 107-054-03 2012-09937 39670 10,600.00 150.00 32.38 1,335.28 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 44.00 35.00

107-054-04 2012-09938 39671 150.00 32.38 6,949.85 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

70 Beacon, R D 127-250-07 2012-10004 44449 5,900.00 150.00 1,998.72 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 63.00 35.00

130-020-02 2012-10000 44818 150.00 3,000.14 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

71 Beacon, R D 127-260-03 2012-09940 44459 18,700.00 150.00 13,650.81 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 5.50 35.00

127-270-02 2012-09941 44461 150.00 1,794.06 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

72 Beacon, R D 127-290-01 2012-09942 44463 82,700.00 150.00 14,798.44 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 8.00 35.00

127-290-02 2012-09943 44464 150.00 48,921.37 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

127-300-06 2012-10001 44470 150.00 7,609.23 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

73 Noel, Ruth 129-030-04 2012-09944 44603 13,800.00 REMOVED - DECEASED
2005-06

74 Beacon, R D 130-030-01 2012-09999 44819 5,300.00 150.00 4,149.97 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 2.50 35.00
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75 Beacon, R D 130-040-01 2012-09945 44820 15,900.00 150.00 2,039.00 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 5.00 35.00

130-040-03 2012-09998 44821 150.00 10,860.16 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

76 Beacon, R D 130-040-04 2012-09946 44822 4,500.00 150.00 3,401.14 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 3.00 35.00

77 Beacon, R D 130-070-02 2012-09997 44832 7,500.00 150.00 1,497.48 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 2.50 35.00

130-080-01 2012-09996 44833 150.00 4,020.54 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

78 Beacon, R D 130-120-03 2012-09995 44850 2,300.00 150.00 402.19 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 2.50 35.00

130-120-04 2012-09994 44851 150.00 491.07 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

79 Beacon, R D 131-010-11 2012-09993 44931 20,300.00 150.00 14,982.53 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 12.50 35.00

131-010-20 2012-09947 44937 150.00 1,902.75 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

80 Beacon, R D 131-010-16 2012-09992 44933 12,000.00 150.00 10,044.39 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 2.50 35.00

81 Beacon, R D 131-010-17 2012-09991 44934 5,000.00 150.00 2,108.59 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 5.50 35.00

131-020-10 2012-09951 44943 150.00 1,204.96 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

82 Beacon, R D 131-020-07 2012-09948 44940 3,400.00 150.00 1,302.43 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 3.00 35.00

131-020-08 2012-09949 44941 150.00 529.71 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

83 Beacon, R D 131-020-09 2012-09950 44942 8,700.00 150.00 3,327.70 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 3.00 35.00

131-020-15 2012-09953 44948 150.00 1,464.40 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

131-120-05 2012-09954 45076 150.00 1,166.76 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

84 Beacon, R D 131-020-12 2012-09952 44945 3,400.00 150.00 2,405.63 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 3.00 35.00

85 Beacon, R D 131-020-14 2012-09990 44947 5,300.00 150.00 2,617.42 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 2.50 35.00

131-120-04 2012-09989 45075 150.00 959.25 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00
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86 Beacon, R D 131-120-06 2012-09988 45077 1,500.00 150.00 771.23 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 2.50 35.00

87 Beacon, R D 131-120-07 2012-09955 45078 8,200.00 150.00 1,897.35 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 3.00 35.00

131-140-08 2012-09957 45095 150.00 2,152.24 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

131-140-09 2012-09958 45096 150.00 1,466.34 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 35.00

88 Beacon, R D 131-140-07 2012-09956 45094 2,000.00 150.00 1,187.63 REDEEMED 4/15/13
2006-07 3.00 35.00

89 Dellobuono, Berton & Michelle 132-074-09 2012-09959 45285 27,900.00 28,000.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 27,205.76 303.74 Surender Punia
2006-07 35.00 185.00 30.80 PO Box 789

3.00 Danville, CA 94526

90 Alvord, Benjamin & Nancy 143-110-06 2012-09960 47013 18,400.00 55,100.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 17,708.08 36,884.42 Laurie Schuyler
2006-07 35.00 185.00 61.05 2041 North Ave.

20.00 Napa, CA 94558

91 Alvord, Benjamin & Nancy 143-110-08 2012-09961 47015 9,400.00 150.00 32.38 7,843.12 REDEEMED 5/3/13
2006-07 150.00 46.50 35.00

92 Graham, Wright E. Ttee 147-252-1201 2012-09962 48944 2,200.00 20,100.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 1,521.99 18,088.01 Linda Gray
2006-07 35.00 185.00 22.55 PO Box 617

2.50 Ukiah, CA 95482

93 Lampach, David & Cara 147-260-1401 2012-09963 48982 19,400.00 49,908.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 18,728.06 30,684.94 John Dugan
2006-07 35.00 185.00 55.00 50 Chilton Ave.

7.50 San Carlos, CA 94070

94 Hayes, Daniel Michael 169-130-03 2012-09964 53378 31,700.00 150.00 32.38 31,795.26 REDEEMED 5/31/3
2005-06 150.00 11.00 35.00

95 Wood, Paulette 172-080-05 2012-09986 54533 5,600.00 150.00 32.38 1,860.35 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-100-03 2012-09967 54542 150.00 32.38 1,034.83 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-150-07 2012-09973 54564 150.00 32.38 1,169.43 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

96 Wood, Paulette 172-080-06 2012-09965 54534 3,000.00 150.00 32.38 2,061.69 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

97 Wood, Paulette 172-080-07 2012-09966 54535 4,700.00 150.00 32.38 920.40 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-130-04 2012-09970 54553 150.00 32.38 2,088.54 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00
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98 Wood, Paulette 172-100-04 2012-09968 54543 4,200.00 150.00 32.38 1,800.30 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-150-08 2012-09974 54565 150.00 32.38 733.77 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

99 Wood, Paulette 172-130-03 2012-09969 54552 2,500.00 150.00 32.38 1,671.78 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

100 Wood, Paulette 172-130-05 2012-09985 54554 6,000.00 150.00 32.38 1,320.94 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-140-03 2012-09984 54558 150.00 32.38 2,767.69 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

101 Wood, Paulette 172-130-07 2012-09981 54555 6,800.00 150.00 32.38 5,513.15 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

102 Wood, Paulette 172-130-08 2012-09982 54556 4,800.00 150.00 32.38 814.90 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-140-04 2012-09983 54559 150.00 32.38 1,037.57 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-150-09 2012-09980 54566 150.00 32.38 687.94 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

103 Wood, Paulette 172-140-05 2012-09971 54560 6,100.00 150.00 32.38 2,121.77 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-190-04 2012-09977 54589 150.00 32.38 1,796.49 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

104 Wood, Paulette 172-140-06 2012-09972 54561 7,600.00 150.00 32.38 968.39 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-160-05 2012-09975 54569 150.00 32.38 1,136.81 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

172-210-01 2012-09978 54594 150.00 32.38 2,873.58 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

105 Wood, Paulette 172-160-06 2012-09976 54570 11,200.00 150.00 32.38 9,419.88 REDEEMED 5/31/13
2006-07 150.00 35.00

106 Harper, Deborah Renee 175-050-21 2012-09979 55175 35,200.00 36,500.55 REDEEMED 1/14/13
2006-07 35.00

107 Sanchez, Froilan G. & Elisa A. 181-131-08 2011-09203 57278 9,100.00 25,300.00 1.50 150.00 100.00 16.00 8,373.24 16,430.26 Wesley Nally
2005-06 35.00 185.00 28.05 141 N. Pacific Ave.

9.00 Rio Dell, CA 95562

Totals 331,609.00 30.00 1,884.89 2,298.11 320.00 664,470.40 190,525.44
700.00 9,495.85 502.50 1,230.00



SALE ASSESSEE PARCEL NO. NOTICE DEF. NO MIN PRICE SOLD FOR STATE COUNTY PUBLIC & RECORDING REDEMPTION EXCESS SOLD TO:
 LOT BK/PG YEAR PORTION PORTION ADVERT FEE TAXES PROCEEDS

PUBLIC AUCTION OF TAX DEFAULTED PROPERTIES -  JUNE 1-4 , 2013 & AUGUST 24-27 , 2013

Report Date 9/18/13 11,850.00 155.00 2,870.00
370.15 133,532.82


